
Florence County

Dept: Parks and Recreation Department

Name of Bidder Trip 1 Trip 2 Trip 3 Trip 4  Trip 5   Trip 6  Trip 7  Trip 8  Trip 9 

PML Tours

Single: $1,220.00  

Double: $979.00
No Bid No Bid

Single: $609.00  

Double: $559.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Single: $389.00  

Double: $339.00

White Star Tours

Single: $989.00  

Double: $937.00
No Bid

Single: $299.00  

Double: $245.00

Single: $669.00  

Double: $519.00

Single:$743.00   

Double: $554.00

Single: $774.00  

Double: $564.00
No Bid

Single: $438.00  

Double: $359.00

Single: $434.00  

Double: $335.00

Notes:

*2% Local Preference-Florence County Code, Section 11-62

Bid Opening Date:  8/8/2013

Time:  2:00 PM

Various Trips (9)
Tabulation for Bid No. 07-13/14 

All bids are thoroughly reviewed to ensure that all specifications as required in the bid package has been satisfied.    A notification of award will not be issued until it has County Council's 

approval and until the expiration period for protest has been met.  

It is always the intent of Florence County to award the lowest priced responsible/responsive bidder (the vendor that is highlighted in bold letters) that best meets the specifications as 

determined by Florence County.  A notice of intent letter will be sent to all bidders only in the case of a bid awarded to another vendor other than the lowest priced responsible/responsive bidder 

as stated on this bid tabulation.  


