
FLORENCE COUNTY, SC

Project:  FENCING AT LAVERNE ARD PARK FOOTBALL FIELD

Company Name of Bidder

Addendum 

No. 2 (Y/N)

 Submitted 

Bid** 

 Local 2% 

Deduction* 

 Bid Total 

w/Local 

Deduction 

 Bid 

Alternate** 

 Local 2% 

Deduction* 

 Bid Alternate 

w/Local 

Deduction 

 Bid Total 

w/Local 

Deduction 

Watford Fencing, LLC, 1725 1.2 S. Irby 

Street, Florence, SC  20505
Y $12,719.00 -$254.38 $12,464.62 $250.00 -$5.00 $245.00 $12,709.62

Frye Fence Co., Inc., 3221 Dirhan Dr. #115, 

Raleigh, NC 27603
Y $13,135.00 N/A $13,135.00 $0.00 N/A $0.00 $13,135.00

Henley's Construction, 2876 Hwy 9, Cheraw, 

SC 29520
Y $13,648.00 N/A $13,648.00 $400.00 N/A $400.00 $14,048.00

Fence It, 608 W. Lucas Street (P.O. Box 388), 

Florence, SC 29503
Y $13,800.00 -$276.00 $13,524.00 $900.00 -$18.00 $882.00 $14,406.00

Allsteel Products Co., 1505 Lake Dogwood 

Dr. (P.O. Box 4300), W. Columbia, SC
Y $14,071.00 N/A $14,071.00 $482.00 N/A $482.00 $14,553.00

The MJB Company, LLC1130 Brentwood 

Drive, Columbia, SC 29208
Y $14,736.02 N/A $14,736.02 $547.20 N/A $547.20 $15,283.22

Newman Fence Co., Inc., 119 Peake Rd. 

(P.O. Box 1359), Roebuck, SC 29376
Y $14,896.20 N/A $14,896.20 $600.00 N/A $600.00 $15,496.20

Ryan Brewer Enterprises, LLC, 1446 

Pineview Drive, Columbia, SC 29209
Y $15,176.40 N/A $15,176.40 $395.00 N/A $395.00 $15,571.40

Ryan Brewer Enterprises, LLC, 1446 

Pineview Drive, Columbia, SC 29209
Y $15,176.40 N/A $15,176.40 $395.00 N/A $395.00 $15,571.40

Hightech Fence and Rail, 536 Corinth Road, 

Newnan, GA 30263
Y $15,217.00 N/A $15,217.00 $483.00 N/A $483.00 $15,700.00

BID OPENING DATE:  3/18/2014

TIME:  11:00 a.m.

TABULATION FOR BID NO. 20-13/14 



Hurricane Fence Co., 3198 W. Oak Street, 

Selma, NC 27576
Y $16,000.00 N/A $16,000.00 $167.00 N/A $167.00 $16,167.00

Guardian Fence Suppliers of SC, Inc., 1103 

Pasture Lane, Columbia, SC 29201
Y $15,748.20 N/A $15,748.20 $780.00 N/A $780.00 $16,528.20

Dudley's Fence Co., Inc. 4136 Fields Station 

Rd. LaGrange, NC 28551
Y $17,880.51 N/A $17,880.51 $300.00 N/A $300.00 $18,180.51

ACME Fence Company, Inc. 5323 Bragg 

Blvd. (P.O. Box 35166), Fayetteville, NC 

28303
N $19,907.42 N/A $19,907.42 No Bid N/A $0.00 $19,907.42

Brabham Fence Company, 2800 William 

Tuller Drive, Columbia, SC 29205
N $18,580.00 N/A $18,580.00 No Bid N/A $0.00 $18,580.00

Seegars Fence Company, 3303 Camden 

Road (P.O. Box 64033), Fayetteville, NC 

28306
N $14,394.00 N/A $14,394.00 No Bid N/A $0.00 $14,394.00

Statesville Fence and Lanscaping, Inc., 1310 

N. Barkley Rd., Statesville, NC 28677
N $29,000.00 N/A $29,000.00 No Bid N/A $0.00 $29,000.00

Notes:

*2% Local Preference-Florence County Code, Section 11-62

**Bid includes sales tax

All bids are thoroughly reviewed to ensure that all specifications as required in the bid package has been satisfied.    A notification of award will not be issued 

until it has County Council's approval and until the expiration period for protest has been met.  

It is always the intent of Florence County to award the lowest priced responsible/responsive bidder that best meets the specifications as determined by 

Florence County.  A notice of intent letter will be sent to all bidders only in the case of a bid awarded to another vendor other than the lowest priced 

responsible/responsive bidder as stated on this bid tabulation.  


